
 

 

 
   
   

   

 

 
 
29 August 2023 

 
Dear  
 

ATISN 18808 
 
Thank you for your request which I received on 31 July 2023. Further to our response 
under ATISN 18638, you asked for the following information: 
 
In relation to Lesley Griffiths attending engagements in North Wales on 22 June 2023: 
 

1. What engagements were these? 
 

Details of Ministers engagements are published quarterly retrospectively Ministerial 
meetings and engagements | GOV.WALES. 

 
2. Why could Lesley Griffiths not travel to her North Wales home by public transport? 

 
As an official car was travelling to North Wales on 21 June to transport the Minister 
to her engagements on 22 June, the decision was made for her to travel in the 
official car rather than separately by public transport. 
 

3. Did the car drive Lesley Griffiths back somewhere after these engagements, and if 
so, where did it drive her to? 
 
Yes, to her North Wales home. 
 

4. Did the car return to Cardiff with any passengers in the car? 
 
Yes. 
 

5. In view of the WG Net Zero Strategic Plan, why is the carbon footprint of individual 
journeys made in fleet cars not recorded, particularly in light of the statement in the 
Strategic Plan? 
 
Individual vehicle journeys in the Welsh Government fleet are not recorded, 
however total fuel usage is recorded. This is used for Welsh Government emissions 
reporting (amongst other reasons). This includes cars that the Ministers have 
access to provided by Welsh Government. 
 

6. Is the carbon footprint of any travel by any minister by whatever means of transport, 
both within Wales and the UK and further afield recorded? 

 
If the transport is provided by Welsh Government, then this data is recorded (as 
above) and would also include rail travel, air travel, and sea travel. If the transport is 
not provided by Welsh Government, we do not collate any data involved as it is out 
of Welsh Government scope. 

 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.gov.wales%2Fministerial-meetings-and-engagements&data=05%7C01%7CCarl.Roberts2%40gov.wales%7C6446a6cc46d24784b21c08dba225ab25%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638282054878823225%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=%2FynIvVcnAQRA1tvqktL6Zh4%2BYKyP9BQ5mdpj8OsfboY%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.gov.wales%2Fministerial-meetings-and-engagements&data=05%7C01%7CCarl.Roberts2%40gov.wales%7C6446a6cc46d24784b21c08dba225ab25%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638282054878823225%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=%2FynIvVcnAQRA1tvqktL6Zh4%2BYKyP9BQ5mdpj8OsfboY%3D&reserved=0


If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can ask 
for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response. Requests for an 
internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s Freedom of Information 
Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit  
Welsh Government 
Cathays Park  
Cardiff  
CF10 3NQ  
 
or e-mail: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:   
 
Information Commissioner’s Office  
Wycliffe House  
Water Lane  
Wilmslow  
Cheshire  
SK9 5AF 
 
Telephone: 0303 123 1113 
Website: www.ico.org.uk      
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until 
it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales
http://www.ico.org.uk/

