
 
 
22 February 2021 
 
 
  
Dear  
 
ATISN14789 Badger Trap and Test data 
 
Thank you for your request which I received on 22 January. 
 
 
You asked for: 
 
1. In relation to the Badger Trap and Test operations carried out in Wales 2020, you 
asked for: 

 Badger ID of all trapped badgers 

 Date of capture for each badger 

 Location of field tests (anonymised) 

 Test results for all badgers- both field and lab tests 

 Number of badgers removed 

 Microchipping/blood samples/release where negative at trapside  

 Vaccination status and date  
 

This information is held by the Animal and Plant Health Agency (APHA). APHA 
will respond to you directly. 

 
2. a) Do you still use the DPP trapside test on badgers that have been vaccinated    
within the preceding 12 months?  
If not, please state the reasons for the change. 
 

No. This procedure was changed ahead of the 2020 trap and test operations.  
 
BCG Sofia can express MPB83 at levels that can induce detectable antibody 
titres in the DPP tests, but this response declines over time. Preliminary 
examination of the results from 2018 and 2019 suggest that there might be 
higher than expected number of DPP trap side test positives in badgers which 
had previously tested negative and been vaccinated. This suggests caution in 
using the DPP test in badgers previously vaccinated with BCG Sofia at short 
intervals and in using it in badgers which have had more than one BCG Sofia 
vaccination. These suggestions concur with results from studies undertaken in 
the Republic of Ireland and Northern Ireland. 
 
In 2020 we continued to only vaccinated badgers once in their lifetime, but 
viewed it unsuitable to make a decision on the basis of the DPP test result if the 
animal had been vaccinated during the previous 12 months. During the trapping 
operations in 2020, only blood samples for the laboratory-based Interferon 
Gamma Release Assay (IGRA) were collected from animals vaccinated within 
the previous 12 months. 
 

 



b) Do you now believe that the DPP test functions as a reliable DIVA test (ie able to 
distinguish vaccination from infection) on badgers that have been vaccinated 12 
months or more prior to the test? 
Please state the evidence for your answer. 
 

See answer to question 2.  
 
3. In the case of previously vaccinated badgers (if any) euthanized in 2020 as the 
result of a positive DPP trapside test at repeat capture, please state 

a) What interval had elapsed since vaccination 
b) how many had a positive result of TB infection at any or all post mortem tests 

(please state which) 
c) How many had no positive confirmation of TB infection at post mortem testing 

 
    We do not hold this information. APHA will respond to this. 
 
4. The data released to me from badger operations in 2018 and 2019  

a) What does this tell you about the efficacy of the DPP testing regime? 
b) What other evidence are you relying on to demonstrate the efficacy of the DPP 

test? 
c) What is the purpose or role of the post mortem testing in the programme? 

 
We do not hold this information. APHA will respond to this. 

 
5. Have any of the above results led you to make any changes to the testing protocol 
and/or TVR programme? 
 

The only change to the trap and test operations which was introduced ahead of 
the 2020 trapping operations was the decision not to DPP test badgers that had 
been vaccinated within the previous 360 days. 

 
6. Please also clarify the following: 
 

a) How many farms in total were issued with licenses for badger operations during 
2020?  
 
7 
 
Of these farms how many were issued with licenses in the previous years of 
the programme (please specify in which years)   

 
6 (2017 – 2019) 
 

b) How many farms in total have applied for licenses for badger interventions to 
date for 2021? How many licenses have been issued to date for 2021? 

 
0 
 
 
 

c) How large an area did the total number of farms involved cover in 2020? Were 
they in High, Medium or Low Risk Areas? 



 
14.87km2.  
All farms were located in the High TB areas. 
 

7. Please also tell me - since the introduction of the WG Refreshed TB policy and up 
to the present day: 

a) How many of the farms using badger intervention are now OTF? 
b) How many were OTF but have since had a further breakdown? 
c) How many of the long term herd breakdown farms which did not use badger 

intervention are now OTF? 
d) How many of c) were OTF but have since had a further breakdown? 

 
We do not hold this information. APHA will respond to this. 

 
8. Please tell me 

a) How long is the TVR element of the WG’s current TB Eradication Policy 
expected to run for? Is there a proposed end date? 

 
The Trap and Test operations are planned to be undertaken on each farm for 
four years. Future actions on each farm will be reviewed once the farms have 
received four years of trap and test operations. The duration of the programme 
has not been set.   

 
b) What specific criteria do you have, or intend to use, to measure the 
success/failure of the TVR project?  

 
We do not hold this information. APHA will respond to this. 

 
c) Are there any factors or evidence from the ongoing data which would cause 
you to pause, or discontinue the project? Please specify. 

 
No, currently there is no intention to pause or discontinue the project. 

 
d) What cost/benefit analysis (if any) has the WG/APHA carried out to support 
the high cost of the badger/TVR element of the TB Eradication programme as 
distinct from the other (cattle based) measures take 

 
No such analysis has been undertaken  

 
9. Please confirm 

a) Is WG now trialling cattle vaccination as an option in the fight against TB? 
 

The research and development of the Cattle BCG vaccine is being undertaken 
by APHA on behalf of Devolved Administrations, including Welsh Government. 
The Cattle bTB Vaccination programme’s aim is to (i) generate sufficient safety 
and performance data needed for APHA to apply for Marketing Authorisation 
(MA) for use of Cattle BCG vaccine and the accompanying DIVA skin test (DST-
F) reagent in cattle in the UK; (ii) generate data needed to evidence the case 
for changes to international standards to mitigate any trade implications of use 
of Cattle BCG vaccine. 
Phase 1 of the Cattle BCG and DIVA skin test field trials is due to start later in 
2021 and  will focus on the DIVA skin test safety and specificity. Phase 2, which 



will involve vaccinating cattle with the cattle BCG vaccine, will probably 
commence in 2022. 

 
b) When does the WG expect that cattle vaccination will be available for use in Welsh 
herds? 
 

Following completion of the trials, if these are successful, both the vaccine and 
DIVA test will then need to go through a process of scrutiny and be sanctioned 
by the responsible authorities as safe and efficacious for use in the UK, before 
any active deployment in cattle herds will be possible in Wales. Many factors in 
the trial or market authorisation process may significantly affect the actual date 
of cattle vaccine roll out, but this process is expected to take several more years 
yet to complete.  

 
As with Covid vaccines, the cattle BCG vaccine is not expected to be fully 
protective for all vaccinated animals and careful consideration will be needed 
as to how it is used in Wales.  
 

c) When/if cattle vaccination is introduced, will the WG continue with any lethal badger 
interventions? 
 

Our TB policy takes into account the latest evidence available. We are making 
strides to understand the involvement of wildlife into the spread of bovine TB. 
It is too early to tell how the introduction of cattle vaccination will influence our 
TB eradication programme. 

 
10. Bearing in mind the ‘hidden reservoir’ of infection in cattle herds themselves, the 
spreading of slurry obviously poses a potential risk for the further spreading of bovine 
TB. There have also been a number of incidents of serious river contamination from 
slurry in Wales involving significant impacts on the environment and wildlife. Please 
tell me, since the introduction of the Refreshed TB policy: 
 

a) How many such incidents have been recorded  
b) Have any incidents of slurry spreading contravening regulations and/or 

involving significant environmental pollution or harm resulted in prosecution of 
or penalties for those responsible? Please specify. 

c) Please also state what the WG are doing to tighten up statutory regulation of 
the spreading of slurry and what measures are being taken to ensure 
enforcement of such regulation. 

 
We do not hold this information, you would need to contact National Resources 
Wales (NRW). 

 
 
Next steps 
  
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can 
ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s 
Freedom of Information Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit,  



Welsh Government, 
Cathays Park,  
Cardiff,  
CF10 3NQ  
 
or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:  Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
Cheshire,  
SK9 5AF. 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint 
until it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
 

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

