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21 February 2018

Dear )
ATISN 11942 - Financial support to the Bevan Commission and MediWales

Thank you for your request to the Welsh Government received on 24 January for the
following information under the Freedom of Information Act (2000). The Welsh
Government holds some of the information you requested.

You requested the following:

1. The amounts, and duration, of core funding provided to the Bevan Commission
and to MediWales since the start of the Welsh Government (1999).

MediWales

2011/12 £113,850
2012/13 £127,683.31
2013/14 £109,266.64
2014/15 £69,999.98

Welsh Government no longer provided core funding to MediWales after 2014-15
Bevan Commission

Core funding has been provided by Welsh Government to the Bevan commission
since Q2 of 2016/17

2016/17 — Q2 £46,250.00
2016/17 — Q3 £46,250.00
2016/17 — Q4 £74,000.00
2017/18 — Q1 £46,250.00
2017/18 — Q2 £46,250.00
2017/18 — Q3 £46,250.00
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gohebu yn Gymraeg yn arwain at oedi.

We welcome receiving correspondence in Welsh. Any correspondence received in Welsh will be answered in Welsh and corresponding
in Welsh will not lead to a delay in responding.



2. Copies of the claims submitted by the Bevan Commission between 2012/13 and
2014/15, and by MediWales since 1999, to draw down the allocated funding.

The Welsh Government holds some of this information and the relevant
documentation is attached. Some of the information contained within the documents
is exempt from disclosure under section 40 (2) of the Freedom of Information Act
and is therefore withheld.

3. Published documentation, considered by the Welsh Government, supporting the
establishment of both MediWales and or the Bevan Commission.

Welsh Government does not hold this information.

4. Documentation considered by Welsh Government which considers the ethical
implications of the work of the Bevan commission and MediWales.

Welsh Government does not hold this information.

5. Information submitted by the Bevan Commission on the provision of tickets and
accommodation to an event in December 2017.

Welsh Government does not hold this information.

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can
ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of the response.
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s
Freedom of Information Officer at:

Information Rights Unit
Welsh Government
Cathays Park

Cardiff

CF10 3NQ

Or email: FreedomOflnformationOfficer@qgov.wales

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The
Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Woycliffe House

Water lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a
complaint until it has been through our own internal review process.

Yours sincerely,
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