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Llywodraeth Cymru
Welsh Government

Eich cyf/Your ref
Ein cyf/Our ref: ATISN 10621

5" September 2016

Dear ,
Complaint in respect of ATISN 10621

Thank you for your letter of 19 August seeking a review of our response to your
recent request for information regarding funding for food festivals.

Your complaint was:

| cannot accept that the Welsh Government do not hold any information on
the questions not answered in this FOI.

| have carried out a review of our response to you of 17 August. You asked 10
guestions, and | see a response was given for points 1-4 and 7-9. On points 5, 6
and 10 our response to you was that we do not hold the information requested.

| understand your complaint to be with respect to our answers on points 5, 6 and 10,
and | have restricted this review to consideration of those points.

Specifically, these points are:

5. From which budgets or other sources of WG funding have Abergavenny,
Conwy and Cardiff applied for and received funding for their food festivals?

6. What criteria do these festivals have to meet before they can apply for
funding from other than the food festival budget?

10. As the budget for this year’s festivals is £160k, can you explain where the
remainder of this budget will be allocated?
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| have spoken with officials who collated the original answer to understand what
searches were undertaken to locate the information requested. | then conducted
additional searches for the information requested. | have consulted with colleagues
in other departments in Welsh Government who have also conducted their own
searches for information.

In conducting these additional searches | have also considered the timescale you
are interested in. Your first question was for:

1. Details of all food festivals that applied for funding in 2016 and received £5k?

Officials responding to your request have therefore interpreted all subsequent questions
to relate to the time period of 2016 (that is all applications for funding from 1 January
2016 to the date of your request). There is some ambiguity as to whether this includes
an application for funding for a food festival taking place in 2016 where the application
was received prior to 2016, so for the avoidance of doubt, | have ensured that the
search specifically includes these.

These searches have not turned up any new information. In particular, under points
5 and 6, Abergavenny, Conwy and Cardiff have not applied for or received any
funding for food festivals from other sources of funding within Welsh Government in
this time period. We hold no information as to whether any other body has provided
them funding external to Welsh Government.

Although they have not applied for funding in 2016, | have established that in some
cases a food festival might qualify for funding from our Major Events Unit, and if
their event were to qualify for funding, the criteria they would need to meet are
described here:

http://gov.wales/topics/tourism/marketingll/majorevents/quidance/?lang=en.

On question 10, you asked where the remainder of this year’s food festival budget
had been allocated and we replied that we do not hold recorded information in
response to this query. | confirm that we do not hold recorded information on these
budget allocations, as the budget has not yet been allocated.

| have considered your complaint in accordance with the procedure outlined in the
Welsh Government's Practical Guide for Making Requests for Information which is
available by post on request or via the internet at:
http://gov.wales/about/foi/makerequest/

If you remain dissatisfied with this response you have the right to complain to the
Information Commissioner. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office,
Woycliffe House,

Water Lane,

Wilmslow,

Cheshire,

SK9 5AF
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Yours sincerely
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Keith Smyton
Deputy Director, Food Division



